
City of Asheboro

March 14, 2013

Chemical Bid Tabulations

Liquid Liquid Flousilcic Sodium Calcium
Alum Caustic Acid Hypochlorite 12% Nitrate

Amerochem Co

NSF CERT (    ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brenntag

NSF CERT (    ) $363.00 $534.92 $581.65 0.815$                 0.24$      *

General Chemicals

NSF CERT (  X  ) $315.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Geo Specialty Chemicals

NSF CERT ( X   ) $437.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Harcross Chemicals

NSF CERT (    ) $433.35 $537.64 $568.00 No Bid No Bid

JCI Jones Chemicals

NSF CERT ( X   ) No Bid $524.00 No Bid $0.7000 No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc

NSF CERT (    ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Key Chemicals, Inc

NSF CERT ( X   ) No Bid No Bid $514.00 No Bid No Bid

Mosiac

NSF CERT ( X   ) No Bid No Bid $663.00 No Bid No Bid

Siemens Water Technologies

NSF CERT ( N/A   ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.584

Suffolk Sales & Service Corp

NSF CERT ( X  ) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.8132 No Bid

Univar USA

NSF CERT (  X  ) No Bid $562.00 $672.00 $0.6380 No Bid

NSF CERT (    )

NSF CERT (    )

MINIMUM BID $315.00 $524.00 $514.00 $0.6380 $0.2400

MAXIMUM BID $437.08 $537.64 $663.00 $0.8150 $0.5840

* Brenntag Calcium Nitrate Bid Withdrawn

Company Name


